Winche_ste_r
/ City Council

FOI REF: 15050

RESPONSE SENT: 14/01/2025

Request

Please could you provide the information below about cashless parking solutions
in your local authority:

1. On which of your sites do you own or operate car parks? Please list.

2. In which of these car parks are cashless parking solutions used? Please
list.

3. For those car parks with cashless parking - what solutions are currently

being used (pay by phone, pay by app, on-line, space booking etc.)? Please

state for each car park.

4. For those car parks without cashless parking, are you considering changing
this? Yes/No

Additionally...
If you do already have cashless parking:

5. Do any external companies provide your cashless parking
solution(s)? Yes/No

6. If yes - for each, please state the company name, the value(s) of the current
contract(s), the start and end dates of the current contract(s), if there are
any extensions in place or planned to these contract(s) and the length of
these extensions.

7. What procurement route(s) did you use to tender for these external
providers of cashless parking? (e.g. via a named framework agreement,
competitive competition, direct award, extension of existing contract, etc.)

8. What is the planned date(s) for re-tender for your contract(s) for external
provider(s) of cashless parking?

9. How do you plan to procure your next external provider(s) of cashless
parking (existing framework, new framework, competitive competition, direct
award, extension of existing contract, etc.)? What is the timescale for this?

If you do not already have cashless parking on some or all of your sites:

10.Do you intend to tender for external suppliers to provide this? Yes/No

11.If yes, please state which sites.

12.For the sites above, how do you plan to procure this external provider(s) of
cashless parking (existing framework, new framework, competitive
competition, direct award, etc.)? What is your likely the timescale for this?
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Response

1. List of car parks where charging applies can be found at
https://www.winchester.gov.uk/assets/attach/43777/Parking-Charges-2024-
2025-1.4.pdf. In addition we operate free to use car parks at Garnier Road and
Hillier Way, Winchester, Harestock, Wickham Station, Wickham and Kidmore
Lane, Denmead and Season Ticket Holders only car parks at Crowder Terrace,
Barfield Close and The Lido, Worthy Lane (all Winchester).

2. Cashless parking solutions are avilable within all car parks where charging
applies https://www.winchester.gov.uk/assets/attach/43777/Parking-Charges-
2024-2025-1.4.pdf

RingGo cashless parking solution in all.

No.

Yes.

RingGo Value: Not recorded as based on fluctuating actuals
Start: 01/12/2024 End: 30/11/2028 with 12 month extension period option
Competitive competition under ESPO Framework agreement
2028-29 or 2029-30

. Not recorded information

10.Not applicable

11.Not applicable

12.Not applicable
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